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All pediatric patients who underwent an OITT craniotomy for a superior cerebellar lesion by a single
surgeon over a 5-year period were included in this retrospective analysis. Patient demographics and
clinical data were collected.

Thirteen pediatric patients were identified. Cases included twelve tumors and one arteriovenous
malformation. Gross total resection was achieved in 92% of cases. No patients developed posterior
fossa syndrome. Two patients had transient homonymous hemianopsia that resolved by 1 month
post-operatively. There were no permanent neurological deficits.

For superomedial cerebellar lesions presenting to the tentorial surface of the superior cerebellum in
patients with normal to steep tentorial angles, the OITT approach is effective and safe. This approach
has a low risk of posterior fossa syndrome and permanent visual deficits when applied appropriately.
Patient selection is critical for maximizing the advantages of the OITT for superior cerebellar lesions 1).

A retrospective analysis was conducted at a single large pediatric hospital. Clinical, radiographic, and
histological data were examined in children who were surgically treated for posterior fossa tumors
between May 1, 1994, and June 1, 2011. The incidence of postoperative facial weakness was
documented. A multivariate logistic regression model was used to analyze the predictive ability of
clinicoradiological variables for facial weakness.

A total of 163 patients were included in this study. The average age at surgery was 7.4 ± 4.7 years,
and tumor pathologies included astrocytoma (44%), medulloblastoma (36%), and ependymoma
(20%). The lesions of 27 patients (17%) were considered high grade in nature. Thirteen patients (8%)
exhibited preoperative symptoms of facial palsy. The overall incidence of postoperative facial palsy
was 26% (43 patients), and the incidence of new postoperative facial palsy in patients without
preoperative facial weakness was 20% (30 patients). The presence of a preoperative facial palsy had
a large and significant effect in univariate analysis (OR 11.82, 95% CI 3.07-45.44, p < 0.01).
Multivariate logistic regression identified recurrent operation (OR 4.45, 95% CI 1.49-13.30, p = 0.01)
and other preoperative cranial nerve palsy (CNP; OR 3.01, 95% CI 1.24-7.29, p = 0.02) as significant
risk factors for postoperative facial weakness.

Facial palsy is a risk during surgical resection of pediatric posterior fossa tumors. The study results
suggest that the incidence of new postoperative facial palsy can be as high as 20%. The presence of
preoperative facial palsy, an operation for recurrent tumor, and the presence of other preoperative
cranial nerve palsy (CNPs) were found to be significant risk factors for postoperative facial weakness 2)

A retrospective study was conducted (from January 2013 to October 2019) at 2 pediatric referral
centers, Children's Hospital of Philadelphia, United States, and Great Ormond Street Hospital, United
Kingdom. Inclusion criteria were younger than 18 years of age and histologically and molecularly
confirmed posterior fossa tumors. Subjects with no available preoperative MR imaging and tumors
located primarily in the brain stem were excluded. Imaging characteristics of the tumors were
evaluated following a predesigned, step-by-step flow chart. Agreement between readers was tested
with the Cohen κ, and each diagnosis was analyzed for accuracy.

Results: A total of 148 cases were included, with a median age of 3.4 years (interquartile range,
2.1-6.1 years), and a male/female ratio of 1.24. The predesigned flow chart facilitated identification of
pilocytic astrocytoma, ependymoma, and medulloblastoma sonic hedgehog tumors with high
sensitivity and specificity. On the basis of the results, the flow chart was adjusted so that it would also
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be able to better discriminate atypical teratoid/rhabdoid tumors and medulloblastoma groups 3 or 4
(sensitivity = 75%-79%; specificity = 92%-99%). Moreover, our adjusted flow chart was useful in
ruling out ependymoma, pilocytic astrocytomas, and medulloblastoma sonic hedgehog tumors.

Conclusions: The modified flow chart offers a structured tool to aid in the adjunct diagnosis of
pediatric posterior fossa tumors. Our results also establish a useful starting point for prospective
clinical studies and for the development of automated algorithms, which may provide precise and
adequate diagnostic tools for these tumors in clinical practice 3).

1)

Peters DR, VanHorn T, Karimian B, Wait SD. Occipital interhemispheric transtentorial approach in
pediatric patients for lesions of the superomedial cerebellum: operative findings and results. Childs
Nerv Syst. 2022 Nov 16. doi: 10.1007/s00381-022-05761-8. Epub ahead of print. PMID: 36380052.
2)

Chu JK, Chiarelli PA, Rea ND, Pimentel N, Flyer BE, McComb JG, Durham SR, Krieger MD. Postoperative
facial palsy after pediatric posterior fossa tumor resection. J Neurosurg Pediatr. 2021 Mar 12:1-6. doi:
10.3171/2020.9.PEDS20372. Epub ahead of print. PMID: 33711807.
3)

Alves CAPF, Löbel U, Martin-Saavedra JS, Toescu S, Tsunemi MH, Teixeira SR, Mankad K, Hargrave D,
Jacques TS, da Costa Leite C, Gonçalves FG, Vossough A, D'Arco F. A Diagnostic Algorithm for
Posterior Fossa Tumors in Children: A Validation Study. AJNR Am J Neuroradiol. 2021 Mar 4. doi:
10.3174/ajnr.A7057. Epub ahead of print. PMID: 33664107.

From:
https://neurosurgerywiki.com/wiki/ - Neurosurgery Wiki

Permanent link:
https://neurosurgerywiki.com/wiki/doku.php?id=pediatric_posterior_fossa_tumor_case_series

Last update: 2024/06/07 03:00

https://neurosurgerywiki.com/wiki/
https://neurosurgerywiki.com/wiki/doku.php?id=pediatric_posterior_fossa_tumor_case_series

