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Foot drop

The term of “foot-drop” describes weakness of the tibialis anterior muscle, the extensor hallucis
longus muscle, and the extensor digitorum longus muscle (dorsiflexor muscles of the foot and ankle).

Etiology

The occurrence of foot drop in critical care patients may result from various underlying causes,
including neurological injuries, muscular dysfunction, nerve compression, or vascular compromise.
Understanding the etiology and assessing the severity of foot drop in these patients is essential for
implementing appropriate management strategies and ensuring better patient outcomes 1)

The top two most common etiologies for foot drop include lumbar degenerative disease and common
peroneal nerve injury at the neck of the fibula. The lower extremity muscles in humans are innervated
by the distal peripheral nerves, derived from anterior horn cells in the lower spinal cord. The axons of
the anterior horn cells in the lower spinal cord travel in the L4 and L5 spinal nerve roots, and these
nerve fibers then enter the lateral trunk of the sciatic nerve.

Although they usually originate from peripheral problems, foot drop is caused by lesions affecting the
neural pathway related to dorsiflexor muscles, whether of central or peripheral origin.

Kim et al. present a patient with a sudden isolated foot drop caused by a small infarct in the primary
motor cortex mimicking a peripheral origin. This report indicates that patients presenting isolated foot
drop should be managed carefully and the possibility of both central and peripheral causes should be
considered. This is the first report of a sudden isolated foot drop caused by a cortical infarction
mimicking lumbar radiculopathy 2).

Differential diagnosis

If lumbar MRI is normal in a patient with evidence of motor weakness (e.g. foot drop), do an EMG to
look for peripheral neuropathy (again, a good motor exam can give the same info). If the EMG is
negative for peripheral neuropathy (e.g. peroneal nerve palsy) then do an MRI (or CT) of abdomen
and pelvis to look for pelvic floor tumor.

Outcome

Preoperative motor strength and time to surgery are the most important predictors of improvement in
foot drop due to degenerative lumbar disease 3).
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Case reports

Bilateral foot drop (BFD) due to LDH is an extremely rare condition with only a few reported cases. We
describe the case of a middle-aged man presenting with a rapid onset BFD with back and leg pain.
Urgent MRI revealed an L4-L5 centrally located LDH with bilateral compression of the L5 nerve roots
and the cauda equina centrally. About 4 h after presentation surgery was performed adopting a
bilateral L4-L5 interlaminar approach and the prolapsed disc was removed. Nine months after
surgery, the patient showed a complete recovery of his deficit. We discuss the advantages of this
approach in this urgent situation and we compare it with other techniques 4).
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